5/16/2012 11:43:26 AM

JEFFERSON TOWNSHIP BOARD OF EDUCATION
Regular Meeting Minutes
Monday, April 23, 2012 — 7:00 PM (Executive Session) 8:00 PM (Regular Session)
Jefferson Township High School Media Center

> s sfe sk sk sk st sie st sfe s sfe sk sk sk st sie st sfe s s sk sk sk sk sie st sie s s sk sk sk sk sk sie st sl s sk sk sk sk sie st sl s sk sk sk skt sie sk s s sk sk sk sk st sk st sie sl sk sk sk koo sk sk sk skoskoskoskok

Mr. Smith, called the meeting to order at 8:00 PM, and read the Open Meeting Statement, below:

In accordance with the Open Meeting Law, the Jefferson Township Board of Education has caused
notice of this meeting to be published by having the date, time and place thereof, posted in the Jefferson
Township Municipal Building, with copies of such notice delivered or mailed or electronically mailed to
the following:

DAILY RECORD, AIM Newspaper, and the JEFFERSON PATCH;

and a copy of said notice delivered to the Municipal Clerk of the Township of Jefferson and the
Jefferson Township Library.

Pledge of Allegiance.

ROLL CALL: Present Absent
Mrs. Castiglione X
Mr. Cuccio X
Mrs. Poulas X
Mrs. Scott X
Mr. Stewart X
Mrs. Van Ness X
Mr. Millar, Vice President X
Mr. Smith, President X
Veronica KOt, Student Representative X
David SWCI'ZCHSki, Student Representative X

CLOSED SESSION

Motion by Mr. Stewart, seconded by Mrs. Scott , that the Board of Education adopt the
following resolution:

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Jefferson Township Board of Education on this 23" day of April,
2012 at 7:03 PM, as follows:

1. The Board shall recess to closed session in accordance with the Open Public Meetings Law,
N.J.S.A. 10:4-12b (1), (2), (6), (7) and (8). The general nature of the discussion will involve
matters confidential by law, any investigations or tactics or techniques to protect persons or
public property, litigation, anticipated litigation and attorney-client matters.

2. These matters will be disclosed to the public as soon as the need for confidentiality no longer
applies.

3. This resolution shall take effect immediately.

The meeting was called to public session at 7:43 PM.
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E. APPOINTMENT TO FILL BOARD VACANCY

As only one candidate applied, the Board voted to fill the vacancy as follows:

Motion by Mr. Stewart, seconded by Mrs. Castiglione, to appoint Melissa Senatore the unexpired term
on the Jefferson Township Board of Education.

MOTION: Mr. Stewart SECOND: Mrs. Castiglione
Name Ayes Nays | Abstain | Absent
Mrs. Castiglione

Mr. Cuccio
Mr. Millar
Mrs. Poulas
Mrs. Scott
Mr. Smith

Mr. Stewart
Mrs. Van Ness

PR D[R DR[| )

The Oath of Office was administered to Mrs. Senatore and she took her seat at the table.

F. SUPERINTENDENT'S REPORT

Mr. Kraemer reported on the Good News and Progress in Our Schools.

G. PRESENTATIONS

e None

H. COMMENTS FROM THE AUDIENCE (on agenda action items only, if applicable)

® An audience member reported the agenda had not been posted on the district website.

I STUDENT REPRESENTATIVES

¢ Student Representative David Swerzenski commented on band competitions and the “Sweet Taste
of Jefferson”.

J. COMMITTEE REPORTS

¢ Building Needs and Finance Committee — Mr. Cuccio reported the Committee discussed the
HS/MS Traffic Control Plan, Solar Panel installation, Legal Representation, Elementary Enrollment
fluctuations and the Field Box Donation.

¢ Education Committee — Mrs. Poulas noted the Committee reviewed the middle school and high
school student schedules — noting it is a goal to release these in a more timely manner. The
Committee also discussed a new teacher evaluation system being implemented by the State as well
as technology and field trips. It was also noted that Mrs. Knutelsky HS Language Arts & Media
Supervisor, was selected to serve on the State Committee to develop model assessments.

¢ Negotiations Committee — Mrs. Scott reported a tentative agreement has been reached with the
JTEA.

¢ AD Hoc Substance Abuse Committee — Mrs. Castiglione reported that she had an opportunity to
meet with Governor Christie and discussed creating decals for local businesses indicating “Not
Here” regarding drug dealing.
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K. MINUTES OF MEETINGS

Motion by Mr. Stewart , seconded by Mrs. Scott , that the minutes of the following meetings be
approved as submitted:

March 19, 2012 Regular Meeting Minutes March 19, 2012 Executive Session Minutes
MOTION: Mr. Stewart SECOND: Mrs. Scott
Name Ayes Nays | Abstain | Absent
Mrs. Castiglione X
Mr. Cuccio X
Mr. Millar X
Mrs. Poulas X
Mrs. Scott X
Mrs. Senatore X
Mr. Smith X
Mr. Stewart X
Mrs. Van Ness X

Motion by Mr. Stewart , seconded by Mrs. Castiglione, that the minutes of the following meetings be
approved as submitted:

March 26, 2012 Public Hearing Minutes March 26, 2012 Executive Session Minutes
MOTION: Mr. Stewart SECOND: Mrs. Castiglione
Name Ayes Nays | Abstain | Absent
Mrs. Castiglione X
Mr. Cuccio X
Mr. Millar X
Mrs. Poulas X
Mrs. Scott X
Mrs. Senatore X
Mr. Smith X
Mr. Stewart X
Mrs. Van Ness X

L. FINANCE AND BUILDING NEEDS COMMITTEE

Motion by Mr. Cuccio , seconded by Mrs. Poulas , to accept the recommendation of the
Superintendent to approve and adopt motions L.1 through L.19, as described below:

L.1  Motion to approve the purchase order list dated March 2012 in the amount of $94,503.01.

L.2  Motion to approve the check journal as of March 2012 in the amount of $3,770.824.61.

Fund Amount

General (10) $ 3,638,976.76
US Jobs Grant (18) $ 51,412.58
Special Revenue (20) $ 80,435.27
Capital Projects (30) $ 0
Debt Service (40) $ 0
Total $ 3,770,824.61

L.3  Motion to certify, in accordance with NJAC 6A:23-2.11(c), that as of February 29, 2012, after review of
the submitted Board Secretary’s and Treasurer’s Monthly Financial Reports and upon consultation
with the appropriate district officials, to the best of our knowledge no major account or fund has been
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L4

L.5S

L.6

L.7

L.8

L.9

L.10

L.11

L.12

over-expended in violation of NJAC 6A:23-2.11(b), and that sufficient funds are available to meet the
district’s financial obligations for the remainder of the fiscal year.

Motion to approve the funds transfers in the 2011-2012 Fiscal Year, dated March 2012 in the
amount of $43,071.20.

Motion that the Board of Education approve the certification by the Board Secretary, pursuant to NJSA
18A:17-9, that as of March 31, 2012, no line item account has encumbrances and expenditures, which in
total exceed the line item appropriation in violation of NJAC 6A:23-2.11(a).

Motion to accept the following donation from the Jefferson Township Rotary Club to the Ellen T.
Briggs Media Center, in accordance with Policy # 7230, Gifts, Grants and Donations.

Item/Purpose Amount

One Datamation MMC steel media cabinet with power $ 1,495
One Casio XJ360 2000 lumens projector (discontinued model) $ 500
One ELMO TT02RX document camera (demo/display unit) $ 495

Motion to accept the following donation from the Milton Tri-PTA to White Rock School, in accordance

with Policy # 7230, Gifts, Grants and Donations.

Item/Purpose

Amount

12 Mini Laptops

$

6,500

Motion to accept the following donation from the Jefferson Township High School PTA to High School
to purchase technology equipment, in accordance with Policy # 7230, Gifts, Grants and Donations.

Item/Purpose Amount
Technology equipment purchase $

7,000

Motion to accept the following donation from the STAR Project Committee, Babe Ruth Baseball and
the Football Booster to the Jefferson Township High School Athletic Department, in accordance with
Policy # 7230, Gifts, Grants and Donations.

Item/Purpose Amount
Baseball-Football Storage and Announcer Building $

13,200

Motion to award bid #2013-001, for Custodial Supplies (unit costs remain constant; however,
quantities may vary depending upon actual items purchased) (See attached bid breakdown sheet)

Motion to approve agreement with the Middlesex Regional Educational Services Commission
(MRESC) authorizing MRESC to solicit proposals on behalf of the Board for the acquisition of various
technology equipment (district) and a replacement maintenance vehicle (district) through a
lease/purchase agreement with the Commission at an approximate cost of $344,875. Board agrees to
pay the Commission $500 for these services. (Subject to attorney review).

Motion to approve resolution as described below:

The Jefferson Township Board of Education will not require Willowglen Academy to apply for and
receive funding from the New Jersey Child Nutrition Program, nor charge students for a reduced
and/or paid meal for any classified students from Jefferson Township Public Schools in accordance
with N.J.A.C. 6A:23-4(a)ii and iii during the 2012-2013 school year.
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L.13 Motion to approve the request for disposal of records per State of New Jersey School District Records
Retention Schedule, as described below:
Volume (Cubic
Record Series No. Record Series Title Retention Period Inclusive Dates Dispose After Feet)
FROM (MM/YYYY) | TO MM/YYYY)
Student Enrollment
0002-0000 Reports 7 years All previous 2002/2003 5 years 3 cubic feet

L. 14 Motion to amend the application and accept the FY 12 No Child Left Behind (NCLB) Funds, in the

total amount of $ 74,085, allocated as follows:

TITLE I - PART A $ 65934
TITLE I IMMIGRANT $ 8,151

L. 15 Motion to authorize application and accept funding to Support Implementation of the Anti-Bullying Bill

L.16

L.17

L.18

L.19

of Rights for July 1, 2011 through June 30, 2012.

Motion to approve the food service management company renewal contract addendum between the
Jefferson Township Board of Education and the Pomptonian, Inc. for the 2012-2013 school year. This
contract, as quoted, includes a management fee of $0.1536 cents per pattern meal and meal equivalent.
Pomptonian, Inc. guarantees a return of $34,000.00 terms and conditions of the food service
management contract between Jefferson Township Board of Education and Pomptonian, Inc. for the
2012-2013 school year.

Lunch Breakfast
Elementary $2.50 $1.15
Middle School $2.50 $1.25
High School $2.75 $1.45

Motion to appoint Fox Architectural Design, PC to prepare construction documents, bidding documents
and contract administration for fire alarm system upgrade and renovations at White Rock, Cozy Lake
and Milton Elementary schools, at a not to exceed cost of $23,550, per proposal.

Motion to approve the Transportation Agreement between the Jefferson Township Board of Education
and the Jefferson Township Parks and Recreation Department to provide transportation for summer
camp trips at a fee of $44.00 per hour from June 27, 2012 through August 23, 2012.

Motion to accept and approve the following resolution in accordance with Travel and Work Related
Expenses NJAC 6A:23B:

WHEREAS, The employees listed in Attachment A, are attending the named professional development
seminars and or/workshops at such identified venues, and

WHEREAS, The attendance at stated function was previously approved by the Superintendent, or
designee, as work related and within the scope of the work responsibilities of the attendee; and

WHEREAS, The attendance at the function was approved as promoting delivery of instruction or
furthering efficient operation of the school district; and fiscally prudent, and

WHEREAS, The travel and related expenses particular to attendance at this function are in
accordance with the state travel guidelines established by the Department of Treasury in NJOMB
circular letter; be it
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RESOLVED, That the Board finds the travel and related expense and the expenses particular to

attendance at this approved function is justified and therefore reimbursable. (copy artached).

MOTION: Mr. Cuccio

SECOND: Mrs. Poulas

Name Ayes Nays | Abstain | Absent
Mrs. Castiglione* X

Mr. Cuccio X

Mr. Millar X

Mrs. Poulas X

Mrs. Scott X

Mrs. Senatore X

Mr. Smith X

Mr. Stewart X

Mrs. Van Ness X

* Mrs. Castiglione Abstained from voting on Agenda Item L.2.

M. PERSONNEL COMMITTEE
Motion by Mr. Millar , seconded by Mrs. Van Ness, to accept the recommendation of the
Superintendent to approve and adopt motions M.1 and M.2, as described below:

M.1 Motion to take action on personnel matters, as listed below; and appoint and submit to the Executive
County Superintendent applications for emergent hiring and the applicant’s attestation that he/she has
not been convicted of any disqualifying crime pursuant to the provisions of N.J.S.A. 18A:6-7.1 et. Seq.,
N.J.S.A. 18A:39-17 et. seq., or N.J.S.A. 18A:6-4.13 et. seq. for those employees listed below: (All
appointments are contingent upon receipt of proper teaching certification and all salary placements are
pending receipt of college transcripts verifying degree status and letter stating years of service in other
districts).

IPERSONNEL
Position/Control Date Date
Name Nature of Action Number Deg/Step Salary Loc. Effective | Termin. Discussion
A. Administrative
| | | | | |
B. Instructional
Teacher of Math
IChelsea Holland Resignation 10.80.80.ARR High School 3/23/12 3/23/12  |Not returning from FMLA
IMath Teacher
Susan Pedersen ILong-Term Sub BA
11-130-100-101-29 IAppoint 10.70.70.AAI Step 1 $233.58/day | Middle School | 4/16/12 6/22/12  |Replacing SS
[Elementary Teacher
Uenna Schuessler ILong-Term Sub BA
11-120-100-101-29 Start Date Change  [10.30.30.AGQ Step 1 $233.58/day Briggs 3/30/12 6/22/12  |Replacing SB
Science Teacher
ILawrence Melli IAssignment Date ILong-Term Sub BA
11-130-100-101-29 Change 10.70.70.APM Step 1 $233.58/day | Middle School | 2/13/12 4/6/12  |Replacing CB
IRachel Zegas IAppoint Bedside Instruction $40/hr District 3/28/12 6/30/12
IEnglish Teacher
PK Unpaid Leave 10.80.80.AQZ N/A N/A High School 9/1/12 6/30/13  |One-year family leave
[Elementary Teacher
MA Unpaid Leave 10.10.10.AGK N/A N/A Stanlick 9/1/12 6/30/13  |One-year family leave
IAdjusted Maternity |Elementary Teacher Utilizing 18.5 sick days
SB Leave 10.30.30.AGQ N/A N/A Briggs 3/22/12 6/16/12  Jand 37 unpaid days
IAdjusted Maternity [Elementary Teacher [Utilizing 30 sick days and 53
IDW Leave 10.50.50.AHF N/A N/A Cozy Lake 3/26/12 11/24/12  junpaid days
IPhysical Education
[Teacher Cozy
IPB Medical Leave 10.50.50.ANZ N/A N/A Lake/Milton 3/13/12 3/24/12  |Utilizing 9 sick days
[Health & Phys. Ed.
IAdjusted Medical [Teacher
AT Leave 10.70.70.APL N/A N/A Middle School | 3/26/12 5/1/12  |Utilizing 20 sick days
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IC. Non-Instructional

3 hrs/day

ICandice Norman Transfer/Assignment (Special Ed. Aide INo benefits
11-215-100-106 Change 09.40.40.BMQ Step 1 $18.76/hr | Milton School | 3/29/12 6/30/12  [New position
3 hrs/day
Michelle Lopez Transfer/Assignment (Special Ed. Aide INo benefits
11-215-100-106 Change 09.40.40.BMU Step 1 $18.76/hr | Milton School | 3/29/12 6/30/12  [New position
Position/Control Date Date
Name Nature of Action Number Deg/Step Salary Loc. Effective | Termin. Discussion
Special Ed. Aide
ICandice Norman Resignation 09.40.40.BMQ Milton School | 4/3/12 4/6/12
3 hrs/day
Manuela Barbosa Special Ed. Aide INo benefits
11-215-100-106 IAppoint 09.40.40.BMQ Step 1 $18.76/hr | Milton School | 4/20/12 6/30/12  |Replacing CN
IConfidential Secretary to
IDonna Guarino |Assistant Supt.
11-000-230-105 IAppoint 12.90.92.AEB $56,000 Central Office | 4/17/12 6/30/12  [Replacing MJ
Special Ed. Aide Utilizing 5 sick days
KB Medical Leave 10.40.40.BCD Milton School | 3/19/12 3/27/12  |And 1 unpaid day
IBus Driver
IFW Medical Leave 10.90.90.BFP District 3/15/12 3/31/12  |Utilizing 12 sick days
IBus Driver
IMR Medical Leave 10.90.90.BFG District 3/20/12 4/4/12  |Utilizing 11 sick days
ID. Substitutes/Other
Susanne Porter Appoint Substitute Teacher $80/diem District 3/27/12 6/30/12
Uessica Demkiw Appoint Substitute Teacher $80/diem District 4/2/12 6/30/12
(Caitlin Gargiulo Appoint Substitute Teacher $80/diem District 3/21/12 6/30/12
IRobert Lenox Appoint Substitute Teacher $80/diem District 4/17/12 6/30/12
IAmani Barkawi Appoint Substitute Teacher $80/diem District 4/24/12 6/30/12
IHoward Pollison Appoint Substitute Teacher $80/diem District 4/24/12 6/30/12
Uanet Arendas Appoint Substitute Teacher $80/diem District 4/17/12 6/30/12
[Barbara Schmitt IAppoint Substitute Aide $10/hr District 3/13/12 6/30/12
IPatricia Milford IAppoint Substitute Aide $10/hr District 3/21/12 6/30/12
Uanice Krakowski IAppoint Substitute Aide $10/hr District 4/18/12 6/30/12
Thomas Hartnett IAppoint Substitute Custodian $12.50/hr District 4/19/12 6/30/12
IE. Student Teacher
IF. Extra Duty Pay
Date Date
Name Nature of Action Position Step Salary Loc. Effective | Termin. Discussion
Gateways Trip 2 nights
Sharon Messerle IAppoint Overnight Trip Nurse $125.00 | Middle School 3/28/12 3/30/12 | at no cost to the district
Gateways Trip 2 nights
Sharon Messerle Appoint Overnight Trip Nurse $125.00 | Middle School 5/23/12 5/25/12 | at no cost to the district
Elective Team Pro-rated for 7 months
Janet King Resignation Coordinator Level 4 $2,344.30 | Middle School 3/31/12 4/1/12 | of EDP
Elective Team Pro-rated for 3 months
Louis Migliacci |Appoint Coordinator Level 4 $1,004.70 | Middle School 4/1/12 6/30/12 |of EDP
G. 2011-12 School Year Coaching Staff
SPRING
Name Nature of Action Position Step Salary Loc. Date Date Discussion
Effective | Termin.
Melissa Kanouse** IAdjusted Salary |Assistant Softball 1 $3538.48 JTHS 9/1/11 6/30/12
IBoys” Volleyball
IAndrew Douglas IAppoint ICoaching Aide N/A N/A JTHS 9/1/11 6/30/12 |[Volunteer
Sean Kelly |Appoint Golf Coaching Aide N/A N/A JTHS 9/1/11 6/30/12 |Volunteer
Joseph Santillo Rescind IBaseball Coaching Aide JTHS
Kelli Costa** Rescind |Assistant Softball JTHS

(**) Out of district coach
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M.2  Motion to approve the Fall 2011 Course Reimbursements as indicated below:

Approval # of

Name College/University Course Title # Credits Amount
Linda Hack Walden University Collegial Interaction and Professional Development 37 6 $ 1389.08
Kathryn Kaminiski Monmouth University Collaborating With Families, Students and Professionals 26 3 $ 694.54
Lauren Masters Georgian Court University Applied Thesis I 20 3 $ 694.54
Meredith Panka Kean University Literacy for Students with Learning Disabilities 5 3 $ 694.54
Renee Simler Kean University Advanced Seminar in Fine Arts 14 3 $ 694.54
Anthony Szwartz Walden University Action Research for Educators 28 3 $ 694.54
Anthony Szwartz Walden University The Impact of Disabilities on Learning and Teaching 4 3 $ 694.54
Jenna Morris Walden University Action Research for Educators 18 3 $ 694.54
Jenna Morris Walden University Strategic Collaboration in Special Education 19 3 $ 694.54
Christy Lang Marygrove College Teacher as Leader 22 3 $ 694.54
Christy Lang Marygrove College Meeting the Needs of all Students 23 3 $ 694.54
Louis Migliacci East Stroudsburg University Data Driven Decision Making 11 3 $ 694.54
Louis Migliacci East Stroudsburg University Elementary and Secondary Administration 12 3 $ 694.54
Lori Johansson Centenary College Seminar in Curricular Education and Assessment Strategies 27 3 $ 694.54
Laura Minneci-Oliyaik | Centenary College Technology in the Classroom 17 3 $ 694.54
Hong Hu Converse College Geometry 40 3 $ 694.54
Hong Hu Converse College Pre-Calculus 41 3 $ 649.00
Hong Hu Converse College Calculus II 42 3 $ 649.00
Hong Hu Converse College Probability and Statistics 43 3 $ 649.00
Hong Hu Converse College Middle School Mathematics 44 3 $ 649.00
Matthew Moscatello Walden University Teacher Leadership For Learning and Teaching 13 3 $ 495.00
Gino Rose Grand Canyon University Introduction to Graduate Studies in College of Education 38 3 $ 463.03
Lori Kircher Walden University Motivating Today’s Learner 3 3 $ 475.00
Rebecca Reichel University of San Diego Educational Technology 101 31 3 $ 385.00
Rebecca Reichel University of San Diego A Primary Teacher’s Guide to Positive Discipline 32 3 $ 385.00
Katherine Pierson University of San Diego Developing Phonemic Awareness in Emergent Readers 33 3 $ 385.00
Katherine Pierson University of San Diego A Primary Teacher’s Guide to Positive Discipline 34 3 $ 385.00
Denise Morando University of San Diego Technology Based Projects 21 3 $ 324.00
Janice Fisher University of San Diego Classroom Management Survival Guide 15 3 $ 311.00
Janice Fisher University of San Diego Using Children’s Literature in the Classroom 16 3 $ 311.00
Melissa Cattafi University of San Diego Reaching Students Through Character Education 25 3 $ 311.00
Kelly Carney University of San Diego Using Children’s Literature in the Classroom 6 3 $ 305.00
Kelly Carney University of San Diego Differentiated Instruction: One Size Does Not Fit All 7 3 $ 305.00
Kelly Carney University of San Diego Active Hands On Science Instruction 8 3 $ 305.00
Kelly Carney University of San Diego Writer’s Workshop in the Elementary Classroom 9 3 $ 305.00
Kelly Carney University of San Diego A New Approach to Spelling Instruction 10 3 $ 305.00
Susan Mathiasen University of San Diego Linking Literacy Assessment to Instruction 30 3 $ 311.00
Susan Mathiasen University of San Diego Developing Phonemic Awareness in Emergent Readers 35 3 $ 267.00
Susan Mathiasen University of San Diego A Primary Teacher’s Guide to Positive Discipline 36 3 $ 267.00
Cynthia Stumpf University of San Diego Linking Literacy Assessment to Instruction 39 3 $ 267.00

MOTION: Mr. Millar SECOND: Mrs. Van Ness
Name Ayes Nays | Abstain | Absent
Mrs. Castiglione X

Mr. Cuccio X

Mr. Millar X

Mrs. Poulas X

Mrs. Scott X

Mrs. Senatore X
Mr. Smith X

Mr. Stewart X

Mrs. Van Ness X

N. EDUCATION, SPECIAL EDUCATION AND TECHNOLOGY COMMITTEE

Motion by _Mrs. Poulas , seconded by Mrs. Scott , to accept the recommendation of the Superintendent
to approve and adopt motions N.1 through N.6, as described below:
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N.1  Motion to rescind student placements and professional services for the 2011-2012 school year, as

indicated below:
Student School Tuition Effective
M/18-6 Daytop Preparatory 3/16/12

N.2  Motion to approve student placements and professional services for the 2011-2012 school year, as

indicated below:
Student School Tuition Effective
M/14-11 Mount Olive High School $7,771.95 2/27/12-6/21/12

N.3  Motion to approve the following day field trips:

School/Group/Activity Location Date(s)

JTHS Transition Education Class Sussex County Fairgrounds, Augusta, NJ April 23, 2012
JTHS Teen PEP “Day of Learning” Rutgers University, New Brunswick, NJ April 25, 2012
Briggs School, Grade K Turtle Back Zoo, West Orange, NJ May 1, 2012
Stanlick School Class Skylands Medical, Lake Hopatcong, NJ May 7, 2012
Stanlick School Class Lakeland Bank/A&P, Oak Ridge, NJ May 9, 2012
Stanlick School Class Jefferson Twp. Library/Municipal Bldg, Lake Hopatcong, NJ May 11, 2012
JTHS — Morris County Teen Arts Festival County College of Morris, Randolph, NJ May 14, 2012
Stanlick School, Grade 5 — 6™ Grade Orientation Jefferson Township Middle School, Oak Ridge, NJ May 14, 2012
Milton School, Grade K — 1* Grade Orientation Cozy Lake School, Oak Ridge, NJ May 22,2012
Cozy Lake School, Grade 2 — 3™ Grade Orientation White Rock School, Oak Ridge, NJ May 29, 2012
Cozy Lake School, Grade 1 Farmstead Estate, Ringwood, NJ May 31, 2012
Stanlick School — Stonybrook Band Festival Stonybrook School, Kinnelon, NJ June 5, 2012
JTHS Zoology Class Lakota Wolf Preserve, Columbia, NJ June 6, 2012
Stanlick School Chorus— White Rock Spring Festival White Rock School, Oak Ridge, NJ June 8, 2012
Briggs School, Grade 2 — 3" Grade Orientation Stanlick School, Wharton, NJ June 11, 2012

N.4  Motion to approve the following overnight field trips:

School/Group/Activity Location Dates
JTMS — Samsung Solve for Tomorrow Grant Awards Ceremony Washington, D.C. April 17 to April 19, 2012
JTHS DECA - ICDC-DECA National Conference Salt Lake City, UT April 27 to May 1, 2012

N.5  Motion to Recognize and Accept the Harassment, Intimidation and Bullying Incidences (HIB)
March 17, 2012 through April, 23 2012.

RESOLVED, THAT UPON THE RECOMMENDATION OF THE Superintendent, the Jefferson
Township Board of Education recognizes the Harassment, Intimidation, and Bullying incidences
reported from March 17, 2012 through April 23, 2012, as summarized below:

School Incidents Reported Confirmed Incidents of HIB
Milton 0 0
Briggs 0 0
Cozy Lake 0 0
Stanlick 0 0
White Rock 0 0
Middle School 4 3
High School 1 0

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Jefferson Township Board of Education approves the remedial
and disciplinary action taken by the building principals.

N.6  Motion designate Friday, May 25, 2012 and Tuesday, May 29, 2012 as snow days for all staff.
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N.7  Enrollment as of 3/30/12:
March 11 Mar. 12
Milton 185 171
Cozy Lake 245 254
IArthur Stanlick 381 376
E.T. Briggs 391 367
IWhite Rock 425 414
Total Elementary 1,627 1,582
UTMS 809 835
UTHS 1,109 1,047
IGRAND TOTAL 3,545 3,464
Tuition students received 2 1
Out-of-district placement 40 43
Students -Home Instruction 17 20
MOTION: Mrs. Poulas SECOND: Mrs. Scott
Name Ayes Nays | Abstain | Absent
Mrs. Castiglione X
Mr. Cuccio X
Mr. Millar X
Mrs. Poulas X
Mrs. Scott X
Mrs. Senatore X
Mr. Smith X
Mr. Stewart X
Mrs. Van Ness X
0. COMMUNICATIONS
e None
P. OLD BUSINESS
e None
Q. NEW BUSINESS
e None
R. PUBLIC COMMENTS

10 -

¢ A Middle School PTA Representative proposed a “Casino Night” as a fundraiser.

® An audience member commented on incentives regarding attendance at the high school concert.

e It was suggested that 2 emails; one dealing with the Township’s prescription drug drop off program
and one concerning drug awareness, which were sent to district staff, be distributed to parents via the
Honeywell Instant Alert system.
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S. BOARD MEMBER COMMENTS

e The Board welcomed Mrs. Senatore, Mr. Kraemer and Dr. Thornton and offered their
congratulations.

e Mrs. Scott commented on a “Nightline” television special focusing on peer pressure and alcohol.

e Mr. Stewart attended school musicals and noted they were well performed.

e Mr. Millar commented on the Ad Hoc Substance Abuse Committee noting there were strong
opinions and communication. He also commented that this helps to create a healthy environment.

e Mrs. Castiglione commented on a “Dateline” television special on “What Would My Kid Do?”
regarding peer pressure. She also commented on the basketball’s travel team, noting that some kids
are feeling left out due to how the team members are selected.

e Mrs. Senatore thanked everyone and expressed her excitement to participate with the Board.

T. ADJOURN

Motion by Mr. Stewart, seconded by Mr. Cuccio, that the meeting adjourn at 8:50 PM.

Respectfully submitted,

Dora E. Zeno
Board Secretary



Total
Expenses/person
daily costs (does

Lodging Cost/ Meal Cost # not include
Event Function Description Trans- Registration | Travel/ | day/person # per day (not | Meal | mileage, parking
Name Date Location (i.e. Seminar Subject) portation | Fee $ Miles (not to exceed) | Nights | to exceed) Days | and tolls)
Using RTI Process to Help Your Students Before
Bavosa, Sherry May 18 Parsippany, NJ They Fall Too Far Behind in Mathematics Own $ 225.00 44 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ 225.00
Apr. 19 Maryland Society for Educational Technology
Daggett, Eileen & 20 Baltimore, MD Conference Own $ 175.00 440 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ 175.00
New Jersey Educational Computing Cooperative:
Using iPads, an NJECC Special Session for Special
Daggett, Eileen May 18 | Montclair, NJ Education Own $ - 50 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ -
Winners Workshop: A Closer Look at the Years 100
Doyle, Elizabeth Apr. 27 Whippany, NJ Best Books for Children Own $ 179.00 20 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ 179.00
All Kids Can Succeed! Effective Interventions for
Gelinas, Pricilla Apr. 27 Livingston, NJ Behavioral & Social Challenges Own $ 130.00 15 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ 130.00
2012 New Jersey Technology and Engineering
Guglielmello, Jane | May 11 Newark, NJ Educators Association Conference and Expo Own $ 165.00 72 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ 165.00
IKester, Matthew May 14 Paramus, NJ Dynamic Stretching Own $ 189.00 84 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ 189.00
Apr. 23
Montegari, Robin & 25 Wilkes Barre, PA College Tour of Northeastern Pennsylvania Own $ - 97 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ -
Moscatello, New Brunswick, New Jersey School Counselor Association
Matthew Apr. 27 NJ Wrestling Coaches Clinic Own $ 50.00 50 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ 50.00
New Jersey Principals and Supervisors Association
IMundi, Karl May 12 Monroe, NJ Annual Meeting Own $ - 150 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ -
New Jersey Educational Computing Cooperative:
Using iPads, an NJECC Special Session for Special
IRusso, Cara May 18 Montclair, NJ Education Own $ - 50 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ -
2012 New Jersey Technology and Engineering
Toth, John May 11 Newark, NJ Educators Association Conference and Expo Own $ 165.00 74 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ 165.00
|VanderPloeg, May 30
IDonna & 31 Edison, NJ Frontline Technologies Training (AESOP) Own $ 595.00 272 $ - 0 $ - 0 $ 595.00
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Northeast Janitorial
Supply Co.

Pyramid School
Products

Spruce Industries

United Sales USA

Qty.

Units| Product #

Detail Description
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Price Total
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Unit

Price Total

Unit

Price Total

Unit
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Unit

Price Tole

Unit

Price Total

Unit

Price Total

Unit
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Unit

Price Totel

Unit
Price

Total

Unit
Price

Total

Misco Products Gorp. Maintenance
Solutions - Majestic Carpet Solutions
Extraction Cleaner (1 gal. jug) (No
Substitute)

No Bid

§ 3984

§ 23004

No Bid

NoBid

NoBid

No Bid

NoBid

No Bid

$

204.00

Ho Bid

No Bid

NoBid

Misco Products Corp. Maintenance
Solutions - Majestic Carpet Solutions
Rinse & Neutralizer - 2 gal. jug (No
Substitute)

NoBid

$ 4113

$ 20698

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NoBid

Mo Bid

No Bid

NoBid

cs

Misco Products Corp. Rebound High
Speed Buffing Créme (1 pint bottles)
(No Substitute)

NoBid

§103.00

$  824.00|

Mo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NoBid

$

1,112.00

o Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Nilofresh Rug & Room Deodorizer -
Spring Mint (12 0z.)

Mo Bid

$ 3856

$ 30848

NoBid

Mo Bid

No Bid

NoBid

Mo Bid

No Bid

$ 4529

36232

NoBid

No Bid

NoBid

Professional Lysol Brand Il
Disinfectant Spray (19 0z.) (No
Substitute)

NoBid

§ 67.28

§ 121104

No Bid

§ 70488 126342

S s440s 151920

Mo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

§ 4243

763.74

§ 6859($ 123462

No Bid

No Bid

Time Mist Air Freshener with Odor
Counteractant - All Fragrances (5.3
0z.) - 12 aerosol cans per case (No
Substitute)

No Bid

§ 4875

$ 19500

No Bid

§ 49§ 9992

No Bid

No Bid

NoBid

No Bid

§ 7957

$

318.28

§ 5498| 8  219.92

NoBid

NoBid

20

Franklin Cleaning Technology -
Lightning Blend System UHS Combo
Cleaner/Maintainer (4 - 1 gal. bottles
per case) (No Substitute)

Mo Bid

§ 69.60

§ 13%6.00

MNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Mo Bid

NoBid

No Bid

$

1,380.00

NoBid

No Bid

No Bid

2

61990

Bay West Dispensor-Eco Soft Paper
Producis Toilet Paper (2-ply 3.75" x
4" - 36 rolls per case) (No
Substitute)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 10,767.50

No Bid

$3095|8 1178525

No Bid

Mo Bid

NoBid

No Bid

$ 4175

§ 1231625

455

71600

Bay West Dispensor-Eco Soft Paper
Products Paper Towels (7.5"x 630" -
6 rolls per case) (No Substitute)

NoBid

§ 3086

$ 1404130

NoBid

o Bid

§ 26317.20

Mo Bid

§3650| 8 1660750

No Bid

Mo Bid

No Bid

NoBid

No Bid

85162:03

Puresan Antimicrobal Foam Soap
(active ingredient is PCMX - no
Triclosan-FDA approved-1800 hand
washings per refill-ADA compliant
dispensors-6/1000ml per case-
fragrance free-dye free) (No
Substitute)

Na Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

o Bid

MNo Bid

§ 4410

$

476280

NoBid

No Bid

No Bid

24

2-Ply White Interfolded Facial Tissue-
100 sheels pr box 8"x8.33"

NoBid

$ 2000

§ 270000

No Bid

$ 16205 2,187.00

$ 14455 195075

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

$

403650

$ 17.99|§ 242885

§ 1599

§ 215885

$

1445

§ 191025

Super-Sorb Liquid Spill Absorbent -
for the sanitary disposal of vomit,
blood, urine and other liquids.

No Bid

§ 3080

§ 5720

NoBid

§ 3544(§  4%8.16

§ 345|8 51030

No Bid

Mo Bid

No Bid

$ 4900

S

686.00

$ 2089| 8 43246

$ 3585

§ 5010

No Bid

Blood Borne Pathogen Clean-up Kit

NoBid

§ 1480

$ 14800

No Bid

$ 1883|§ 18630

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

No Bid

§ 1990

199.00

Mo Bid

to Bid

No Bid

Premiere Pads - High Performance
Stripping Pads (Black - 20") (No
Substitute)

No Bid

§ 2445

§ 181370

No Bid

s 1679(s t0814] 1§

§ 78042

No Bid

NoBid

Mo Bid

$

1,508.10

§ 2135(§ 1409.10

§ 2807

§ 185262

No Bid




All American Polly|| o o { Circle Janitorial Interhoro Pckg Liberty Paper & z Northeast Janitorial| | Pyramid School ; ;
Corp. Bio Shine Corp. : Central Polly Corp. Supply Co. E A Morse & Co. Corp. Janitorial Co. NY Packaging Co. Supply Co. Producls Spruce Industries | | United Sales USA
i Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
# | Qty. | Units| Product # . ‘ i g 4 + : - ; . :
y.| Units| Produc Detall Description Price Total Price Tolal Price Total Price Total Price Tolal Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total bilis Total
28| 20| cs Prelmlere Pads _,REd Bufﬁng Pﬂds No Bid § 1419|5 28380 No Bid $ 1879 § 33580 $ 23640 No Bid No Bid No Bid $  457.00||§ 1535|S 30700 $ 2038 407.60 NoBid
(20") (No Substitute)
291 20 | cs Pre‘lymere Pads ",Red Buffing Pads No Bid $ T40(S  14800f| MNoBid $ 869§ 173.60 §  12300| NoBid NoBid Mo Bid § 282000 (8 863[S 17380) S 1076 21520 [ NoBid
(13") (No Substitute)
30[20 | cs Pfemxere"Pads-Whllf.a Polishing No Bid s 1419(s  26380)| NoBid S 18275 38540 s 2840f| Noid NoBid NoBid s 4s1.00| [ 1535) s a07.00{[§ 2038 407.60| | MoBid
Pads (20") (No Substitute)
3|15 s PremlereﬂPads-Whll? Palihing No Bid § 740($  11100)| NoBid § 869[S  13035 s 925)| MNoBid NoBid NoBid s atisoffs se|s  308s) s 1078 fet40f | Noid
Pads (13") (No Substitute)
2 Betco Gametime Cleaner -
32| 4 |botle maintenance cleaner for wood floors, | Noeid § 8163|$  2852f| NoBid Mo Bid No Bid ho Bid NoBid NoBid $ on.44|$  38856) | NoBid NoBid NoBid
8 concentrate 1:64 (No Substitute)
" $142 per
Bl 1] cs ErgolecSafely Scraperg b!ade No Bid $137.50 | § 13750 No Bid case $2.84| § 14200 | $ 117.00|§  117.00 Ho Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid
holder (50 per case) L.
W
34| 4| bx ErgotecSafely Scraperg blades No Bid § 1463| §  5852[[ MoBd $ 709|s 283[|s 1300|§ 5200(| NoBi NoBid No Bid Mo Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid
(100 per box)
Unger - The Light Duty Scraper (48"
handle, 4" zinc alloy angled head,
3| 14| ea ans ed (. emera gim and wax No 8id s 8658 12010f[ NoBd § 15195 21266[| s 1500[$ 21000 NoBid No Bid NoBid § 2200|s 0800 |$ 1489] s 20346 f| NoBi NoBid
buildup along haseboards or floors
with ease-double-sided blade for hard
and soft floors) (No Substitute)
Unisan Toilet Bowl Mop - 4 1/2"
o . £85.00
36 3 cs Slrands OfaCId res'?tam " . NoBid $6000|§ 27000 No Bid 100/cs $195.00 $ 5000|s 15000 No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid $ 4900|$  147.00 No Bid NoBid
polypropylene - White - 12" plastic 65
handle
37| 30| ea 32 oz. PIa;tlc Bollles‘(nalural COIOI’ No Bid § 055§ 16.50 NoBid § 070(§ 2100(| S 045(8§ 13.50 No Bid Ho Bid No Bid $ 095)% 250(|s 041]5 1230|| NoBid No Bid
with quantity graduations)
W "
38| 30 [ ea 91 Slanqard Tngger Sprayer o NoBid $ 068] 8 2040|| NoBid $ 062|6 1860||$ 040|$ 1200|[ Nogd No Bid No Bid 2850 |$ 037|$  11.10|| NoBd No Bid
32 oz. plastic bottles
Unisan Clip-on Dust Mop Frames (24
3|12 ea x5) Zinc plated, rust-resistant 1/4" | MoBid $ 4905  s380|| NoBid § 4i7)s  5004f|s 300(s  600|| NoBd No Bid NoBid o600f|$ 241§  2692)| Noid No gid
wire with rounded ends
i $6468
40| 5 cs Un]san Supef Loop Mop Head (Lg No Bid $ 92408 46200 No Bid case $5.39]  $32340 $ 113285 56640 No Bid No Bid NoBid T7A5F| $ 5318 8 28560 NoBid No Bid
Blue - 12 mop heads per case) e
i $5364
4 5| cs Unisan SuPer L00p MOP Head (MEd' No Bid $ 6600 (s 44000 NoBd case $4.47|  $26820 § 9156|§ 457.80| NoBid o Bid NoBid 67500] | § 46.44|§ 23220 MNoBid No Bid
Orange - 12 mop heads per case) e
Unisan 60" Quick Change Handle
(hinged side latch with roller
42/ 12 | ea adjustment knob for easy NoBid $1000( 8 12000f| NoBid $ 550|s  67.08[| s 642|s 72.04]| NoBid NoBid NoBid § 798|s  9s78|| NoBid No Bid
loading/plastic head, 15/16" dia. X
60)
Rubbermaid Toilet Bowl Brush -
it i $128 per
43 3 | ¢s synlh§llcpolypropyl.ene bnstlef No Bid $ 42008 12600 NoBid case§1.28) §  384.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid 687||S 47.04(§ 14192 NoBi No Bid
(plastic handle - white - 14 1/2") (No e,
Substitute)




All American Pollyl| . o, Circle Janitorial Interboro Pckg Liberty Paper & i Northeast Janitorialf |  Pyramid School i ;
Corp. Bio Shine Corp. ‘CemraIPolinorp. Supply Co. E AMorse & Co. Corp. Janitorial Co. NY Packaging Co. Supply Co. Producs Spruce Industries | | United Sales USA
. . oo Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
# | Qty. |Units| Product # |
Qty. {Units| Producl Detail Description Price Tola Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
Rubbermaid Mopping Combo Pak -
4 6| e hegvy-dutydownwardp fesslie NoBid $157.00 |5 o4200]] $ 260005 1360.00f [ 5418 s 32508]| s 15266 |5 otseal| NoB Mo Bid NoBid $19857 (5 110142 | $13798| s  827.88)| NoBid NoBid
wringer (Lg. - 44 quart) (No
Substitute)
Rubbermaid Nylon Finish Mop-Large
45 12| s (nonlinting, continuous white filament | Moeid § 90.00|8 1,15200]| NoBid $ 6028(§ 72312f|$ e918|$ ak0d6[| Mo NoBid NoBid S12180( § 146160 S 7314| S ermes|| Nomid No Bid
yarn, 1" headband) (No Substitute)
Rubbermaid Lobby Dust Pan Broom -
46 20 | ea Black(.85"dla.,27 long wood No Bid § 563[S 11260/ NoBid $ 648§ 12060|| S 498(S 9960|| NoBid No Bid NoBid $ 727($ 14540[|§ 598§ 11960| NoBid NoBid
handle, 35" overall length) (No
Substitute)
Rubbermaid Lobby Pro Upright Dust
47/ 12 | ea Pan - Black (12 1/2" wide, 37" overall | MoBid § 15638 187.6]| NoBid S 029§ 11148||$ 1472($ 17664|| NoBid No Bid NoBid $ 1891(s 2802(|§ 1398 § 16778 || NoBid NoBid
height) (No Substitute)
Polywool Dusters - washable,
synthetic duster-durable, flexible
48 20 | ea head, plastic handle with hang-up NoBid $ 10.85(5  21900(| NoBid S 848§ 16960|| NoBid NoBid No Bid NoBid § 13000 § 20000 § 15060 || NoBid HNoBd
hole and Metal Extension Handle (51"
to 83") (No Substitute)
"
4960 ea AstroLlan Dust Mop (24") (No No Bid s 1178[s  10880)| NoBd § 17.29(s 1,03740)| NeBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid §  6140|| Nobid No Bid
Substitute)
50| 150 bx Kleenguard Powder-fr.ee Blue Nitiie No Bid $ 138§ 1.707.00|| NoBid s 1283)s 192450[| s 1129[s 16950f| NoBid NoBid NoBid S 947|S 137550]| MoBd NoBid NoBid
Gloves (L) (No Substitute)
5[ 125 cs Kleenguard Powder-free Blue Nitre | ., s 138] 5 142250]| Mo s neafs tsoars|| SN tanasf| nosis NoBid NoBid s at7|s fueas|| Nesid NoBid NoBid
Gloves (XL) (No Substitute) :
§2[ 20 | cs Unnal Scre?,n-hlghlyﬂe)ﬂble/moldsto No Bid § 1600 § 32000 Mo Bid § 3553 § TI060|| S 1200|§ 240.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid § 1900(§ 38000 ($ 1169(§ 233.80|| NoBd No Bid
shape of urinal (red/cherry)
83[ 10 | s 4oz.UnnaIDe0donzer Blocks (pure No Bid § 980 s  900|[ NoBd § %455 3ess0|[s er8(s s73e0)| NoBid NoBid NoBid S 1300(§ 12000f|$ 514§  5140f| NoBid NoBid
paradichlorobenzeng)
Panasonic Upright Vacuum Cleaner
54| 18| cs Vﬁ”gm Bags (3 Tab Lock-Type U-6) (No No Bid § 234008 42120 NoBid No Bid Mo Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid § 6400($ 1,15200[| NoBid No Bid NoBid
Substitute)
85| 6 | cs | 611784 TennanldL‘lalMolorVacuum Bags No Bid $23308|§ 139838 No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid Mo Bid No Bid NoBid
(No Substitute)
56| 16 | cs Medium-Duly Scrubbing Sponge - 3.6 Mo Bid § 80|  2we0|| NoBid $ 1526( s 2u418||$ 1400[s 22400|| NoBid NoBid NaBid NoBid § 10595 16944|| MoBi NoBid
x6.1x0.7 (20 sponges per case)
1) 12 cs S.0.5. Steel Wool Soap Pads(1§per NoBid 53760(s  45120[| NoBid § 3588 (5 4305 5 32780|| MNoBid NoBid NoBid § 4800(§  5%6.00 §  s220|| NoBd NoBid
box/12 box per case) (No Substitute)
68 10| cs Medium-Duly Scour Pad (89 - 20 NoBid S 460§ 4600|| NoBid s 618|s eleo||S 450|§ 4s00f| MoBid NoBid NoBid s oe0|s oo0offs 374|s 34| rosd NoBid
pads per case)
Kraft Waxed Paper Receptacle Liners
8| 7| cs NoBid $ 213§ 15491]( NoBid $a60(s z22||s toss|s 137.06)| NoBd NoBid NoBid $ 3900|s 273.00|| 19958 13085|| MoBid No Bid
742Wx3 12D x 10 14 H '
60| 6 | ea CleanMax Pro Series Hepa NoBid $23300( § 1,398.00f| MNoBid $ W47 142482|| NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid NoBid
81| 24 | pack Uf;%ﬂ Panas.onlc Belt (2 perpack) (NO No Bid § 23|§ 512 NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid
Substitute)
62) 12 | ea Aagggﬂ Panas.onlc AgllatoryAssy. 225 (NO No Bid $ 28035 31238 NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Substitute)




All American Pollyf| .. .. Circle Janitorial Interboro Pckg Liberty Paper & : Northeast Janitorial| [ Pyramid School i i
Bio Shine Corp. entral , E . i ng Co. ited Sales USA
Corp. p. | Central Polly Corp, Supply Co. A Morse & Co. Corp. Janitorial Co. NY Packaging Co. Supply Co. Products Spruce Industries || United Sales US
i ¥ Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
#| Qty.|Units{ Product # Detail Description " Total : Total 5 Total ¢ ; Total 5 Total ; Total # : - : : Total
Yy il Deseriptio Price Price Price Price Tt Price Price Price f Price okl Price Tolal Price Total Price told Price
Kimberly Clark Professional
63) 10 | ca Microfiber Cloth Wydall Microban NoBid §6045| 5 60450 Mobid § 4593(5 45030 (| NoBid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid § 0286(s emo0f[§ 1188]5 11880f| NoBid NoBid
(15.75" x 15.75")
64| 4 | cs Maxi Thins NoBid § 3480 (s 13920| NoBid $ 3805($ f4420(|S 3284 (5 13138[| NoBid NoBid No Bid NoBid $ 3025|§ 12100)| MoBid NoBid
65| 4 [ cs Mini Pads NoBid $ 483008 19720 No Bid NoBid $ 44048 17816 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid
Trash Can Liners LDPE
66] 450 cs 16x14x37.002 Black. Must send $1134| s 510300(($ 1822($ 8199.00 (S:ﬁ\] § 3,105.00f [ NoBid NoBid $14481100 § 6,516.00) | NoBid §1539(§ 692550( | $ 10309 § 4639050 | NoBid § 892($§ 374400]| MNoBi
sample with Bid Package.
No Bid No Bid é;eg) § 432000(| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid é_!;?g $ 576000 NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid
Trash Can Liners LDPE 36x58x.002
67/ 500| cs Black. Must send sample with Bid | s1s57| s 788500]| s 2675 s 13375.00 (3::28 $ 760000|| NoBid NoBid $21.41100 | § 1370000 | NoBid § 2895(§ 1447500 [ § 2000( 5 1095000 | MoBid § 1966(§ 9.96000)|§ 20005 10,000.00
Package.
NoBid No Bid g‘“’" $ 890000]| NoBid No Bid Mo Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
NoBid NoBid é_i;‘c‘; $ 1170000 | NoBid NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
68 25 | cs | FP-TC 14x20-H|-0ulput§lnp Fad for No Bid 5 3084 (s e.00|| NoBid NoBid § 3082|s 77080[| NoBid NoBid NoBid § 4425(5 110525| (s 2098 (s s9050|[§ 1634 (s 40850[ | NoB
Tomeat Edge Machine
69] 25 | ¢s | FP-TC 14x20 Black Pad (5 per case) for NoBid s 3400(s  8s0.00f| NoBid s 3676|5 91000||S 18208 455.00|| NoBid NoBid NoBid § 300(s orsoof|s 1359 (s 33975 $ 1634 (s 40850]| NoBi
Tomcat Edge Machine
70| 15| ¢s | FP-TC 14x 20 Surface Pmp Pad (10 per No Bid $ 9540 | § 1431.00(] NoBid $ 91.08|§ 136590 NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid $ 8900 133500( (S 4789 71835(|S 1634 |5  245.10| | NoBd
case) for Tomecat Edge Machine
7| 25| ¢s | FPTC 14x20 Red Pad (5vpercase)fur NoBid $3400|S 85000 NoBid $%76(s o000||S 18205 4s500)| MoBid No Bid NoBid s u00[s ssocof|S 1357(5 33025||5 1634 (5 40850|| Mo
Tomcat Edge Machine
72| 25| ¢s | FPIC 14x20 Green Pad ,(5 per case) for NoBid $ 3400(s  s000]| NoBi § 36.76( s  1900] (5 14320 |§ 358000f| NoBid NoBid NoBid $ 64|s 08600 NoBid $ 1834]S  40850[| NoBd
Tomcat Edge Machine
73| 18] cs | FPTC wapNarson Paq {{Wpet oaB8) for No Bid $18400 [ § 276000 (| NoBi $ 91.08[5 138500[|$ 2611[s 30185|| NoBid NoBid NoBid § 89005 133500] [$ 1899(§ 28485(|S 25895  388.35|| NoBd
Tomcat Edge Machine
74/ 10| cs | 307934 14x20\lelcr0281c!ed Sheet for HNoBid 5 4500 (§  45000)| NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBd NoBid No Bid $ 4113|430 | Nosid NoBid NoBid
Tomcat Edge Machine
'OTAL AMOUNT BID $20,21600 | 321 |
TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED S 768500 53245691 5 - ['s 26316 § 260197 $ 851600 s 3390275 s sous | [s osssm] ['s 1essee] § $ 181025

Bid Substi enNo Sub was noted g
tem didn't mest specifications : |




